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Sequence number and 
frame start



Start of Frame

The current solution uses a single bit to 
indicate start of frame

Frame and Packet start must be aligned
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Sequence Number

The current sequence number scheme 
increments with a constant value per 
packet, irrespective of contents of the 
packet

The sequence numbers thus do not 
definitively hold information about the 
location of the data within the stream
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Start of Frame proposal

We propose aligning sequence number 0 
to the start of the frame (Could be every 
N Frames) 

This would eliminate the need for a Start 
of Frame bit

The sequence numbers would carry 
information about the location of the data 
within the frame (Could be used to deduce 
HFN number)
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Byte counter

We also propose that the sequence 
number is defined as a byte counter

The counter value relates to the first byte 
in the packet

This would be a generic way of 
understanding the location of the data 
within the frame

Frame boundaries would not need to be 
aligned to packet boundaries
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Example
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Transmitter

Receiver

Frame 0
100 bytes

Frame 1
100 bytes

Frame 2
100 bytes

Frame 3
100 bytes

Packet 0
Seq 0

Packet 1
Seq 80

Packet 2
Seq 60

Packet 3
Seq 40

Packet 4
Seq 20

Frame 0
100 bytes

Frame 1
100 bytes

Frame 2
100 bytes

Frame 3
100 bytes

Packet 0
Seq 0

Packet 1
Seq 80

Packet 2
Seq 60

Packet 3
Seq 40

Packet 4
Seq 20

Frame pulse #0Frame pulse #0Frame pulse #1Frame pulse #1Frame pulse #2Frame pulse #2Frame pulse #3Frame pulse #3

Frame pulses release buffers 

Ethernet Network



Packet loss handling
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Receive RAM

Size 614400 

Bytes
Read Pointer 

Start Addr = 0

Read Pointer End 

Addr = 614400

Increment constantly 

through samples

Packet 1

Seq 0

Packet 2

Seq 14400

Packet 3

Seq 114400

Packet 5

Seq 314400

Packet 1

Seq 414400

Packet 1

Seq 514400

Packet 4

Seq 214400

Addr = 0

Addr = 14400

Addr = 114400

Addr = 214400

Addr = 314400

Addr = 414400

Addr = 514400



What about frame number?

Neither current implementation, nor byte 
counter contain frame number

Sending frame number in every packet 
may be redundant

Could the extended header be used for 
this?

Could control packets be used to convey 
this?
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